Maryland Grain Bids

Wednesday August 10, 2016

Cash Bids Harvest Bids
Upper Eastern Shore Upper Eastern Shore

Low High Average Harvest Low High Average
$3.27 $3.68 $3.44 Corn No. 2 16-Dec $3.18 $3.55 $3.32
$3.62 $3.77 $3.65 Wheat No. 2 17-Jul $4.19 $4.19 $4.19
$2.30 $2.30 $2.30 Barley No. 3 17-Jul No Bid No Bid No Bid
$9.48 $9.83 $9.74 Soybeans No.2 16-Nov $9.08 $9.28 $9.22

Mid Eastern Shore
Low Average Harvest Low High Average
$3.37 $3.56 Corn No. 2 16-Dec $3.33 $3.45 $3.36
$3.62 $3.72 Wheat No. 2 17-Jul $4.19 $4.19 $4.19
$2.30 $2.30 Barley No. 3 17-jul NoBid NoBid NoBid
$9.48 $9.63 Soybeans No. 2 16-Nov $9.08 $9.38 $9.23

Lower Eastern Shore Lower Eastern Shore
Low Average Harvest Low High Average
$3.42 $3.50 Corn No. 2 16-Dec $3.38 $3.48 $3.41
$3.62 $3.62 Wheat No. 2 17-Jul $0.00 $0.00 #DIV/0!
$2.30 $2.30 Barley No. 3 17-Jul $0.00 $0.00 #DIV/0!
$9.98 $10.03 Soybeans No.2 16-Nov $9.43 $9.53 $9.48

Central Md
Average Harvest Low Average
$3.49 Corn No. 2 16-Dec No Bid No Bid
No Bid Wheat No. 2 17-Jul No Bid No Bid
No Bid Barley No. 3 17-Jul No Bid No Bid
$9.53 Soybeans No.2 16-Nov $9.23 $9.23

Western Md
Low High Average Harvest Low Average
$3.65 $4.50 $3.89 Corn No. 2 16-Dec $3.24 $3.50
$4.08 $4.20 $4.15 Wheat No. 2 17-Jul $4.58 $4.58
$2.60 $3.45 $2.91 Barley No. 3 17-Jul $2.60 $2.60
$8.70 $9.75 $9.33 Soybeans No.2 16-Nov $8.72 $8.98

State Average Today's Today's Today's Last Week Compared to Avg Last Avg Last
Low High  Average Average Last Week Month Year
$2.97 $4.50 $3.61 $3.69 (50.08) $3.79 $3.88
$3.68 $4.20 $3.77 $3.59 $0.18 $3.77 $4.40
$2.30 $3.45 $2.55 $2.43 $0.12 $2.43 $2.34
$8.70 $9.64 $9.50 $0.14 $10.64 $9.56

Wheat Soybeans

$4.40 $10.64

' $9.64 $9.50 $9.56

Today Last Last Last Year Today LastWeek Last LastYear Today Last Last Last Year
Week Month Month Week  Month

$3.77 $3.59 $3.77
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